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Coverings has announced the top 10 ceramic tile trends for 2023 on National
Tile Day. The tile trends were gathered and forecasted by the three leading
international tile associations and sponsors of Coverings 2023 – Ceramics of
Italy, Tile Council of North America and Tile of Spain – to highlight the most
popular, on-trend styles of tile from the global marketplace. The top 10 tile
trends provide a sneak peek of the immersive displays being planned for
Coverings 2023, which will take place April 18-21, 2023, at the Orange County
Convention Center in Orlando, Florida. 

TILE TRENDS

COVERINGS TILE TRENDS FOR 2023

 
Coverings 2023 commemorates National Tile Day with annual Top 10 Tile
Trends for 2023!
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WABI SABI
SPARANO + MOONEY ARCHITECTURE is a leading architecture and design firm
with offices in Salt Lake City and Los Angeles. The firm was established in 1997
by John Sparano and Anne Mooney and is now under the leadership of the
founding partners along with Ludwing Juarez, Nate King and Seth Striefel. The
practice has been consistently recognized for design excellence and has
received over 50 design and honor awards since 2000. Sparano + Mooney
Architecture was named the 2017 American Institute of Architects Western
Mountain Regional Architectural Firm of the Year and the 2013 American
Institute of Architects Utah Architectural Firm of the Year. John Sparano, FAIA,
has served as the President of the local chapter of the AIA and has won both
the Bronze and the Silver medal for his achievements in architectural practice,
the highest honors given in the region. John was elevated to fellowship in the
American Institute of Architects in 2015.
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WABI SABI 

SPARANO + MOONEY Architecture new residence project Wabi Sabi, located
in Emigration Canyon just above Salt Lake City, in Los Angeles celebrates a
uniquely elevated canyon view with a rare and direct connection to nature
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British architect David Chipperfield has been awarded this year's Pritzker
Architecture Prize for his "understated but transformative" body of work that
spans four decades. Chipperfield is the 52nd winner of the prestigious Pritzker
Architecture Prize, which is considered the most significant award in
international architecture. Born in London in 1953, Chipperfield began his
career after graduating from the Kingston School of Art in 1976 and later from
the Architectural Association in 1977. He worked for fellow Pritzker
Architecture Prize laureates Norman Foster and Richard Rogers, before
establishing his eponymous studio David Chipperfield Architects in London in
1985. 

 

British architect David Chipperfield wins 2023 Pritzker Prize award!
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